
1901

Panaji, 4th January, 2018 (Pausa 14, 1939) SERIES I No. 40

Reg. No. G-2/RNP/GOA/32/2018-20 RNI No. GOAENG/2002/6410

PUBLISHED  BY  AUTHORITY

GOVERNMENT OF GOA

Department of Civil Aviation

Directorate of Civil Aviation
___

Order

DOCA/Notes/42/247/719

Procedure for payment of additional three

times compensation to the legal heirs of

the deceased to whom the amount has

been sanctioned.

Government has sanctioned additional

compensation of three times the value of land

acquired to the persons whose lands have

been acquired and claims have been settled

by the Special Land Acquisition Officer

Suggestions are welcomed on e-mail: dir–gpps.goa@nic.in

(SLAO) or by any Court under the provisions

of Land Acquisition Act, 1894 (Central 1 of

1894) in respect of Mopa Airport Project.

In some cases additional three times

compensation amount sanctioned by the

Directorate of Civil Aviation could not be

disbursed as the Directorate received

intimation from the relatives that the party

to whom the additional three times

compensation has been sanctioned has

expired. In order to disburse such additional

three times compensation amount to the legal

heirs following procedure shall be followed:—

1. Additional three times compensation will

be released to the legal heirs based on

inventory proceedings produced by the

claimant/s or;

Department   Notification/Order Subject Pages

1. Civil Aviation Ord.- DOCA/Notes/42/ Procedure for payment of additional three times 1901

Secretary /247/719 compensation to legal heirs.

2. Finance Ord.- 6/3/2017-Fin(R&C)/ Revival of posts. 1902

Under Secretary /213

3. Labour Not.- VI/FAC-6(L-1)Part- The Goa Factories (Fourteenth Amendment) 1903

Chief Inspector & ex officio -1/IFB-2017/3672 Rules, 2017.

Joint Secretary

4. Mormugao Port Trust                — RR.— Mormugao Port Trust. 1904

INDEX

There are two Extraordinary issues to the Official Gazette, Series I No. 39 dated 4-1-2018 as follows:–

(1) Extraordinary dated 30-12-2017 from pages 1891 to 1894 from Department of Law & Judiciary, Legal Affairs Division,

Not. No. 7/23/2017-LA regarding the Goa Appropriation (No. 4) Act, 2017.

(2) Extraordinary No. 2 dated 3-1-2018 from pages 1895 to 1900 from Department of Finance, Revenue & Control

Division, Not. No. 38/1/2017-Fin(R&C)(36) regarding the Goa Goods and Service Tax (13th Amendment) Rules, 2017 and

Not. No. 38/1/2017-Fin (R&C)(36) regarding Online/Digital Weekly Lotteries Scheme.

NOTE



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 40 4TH JANUARY, 2018

1902

2. In the absence of inventory proceedings,

the claimant/s has to produce deed of

succession. If all the successors as per

the succession deed submit the claim

then the compensation amount to be

released to all the legal heirs. In case

the claim is not by all the successors

mentioned in the succession deed then

the compensation amount is to be

released on pro-rata basis, or;

3. In case of the claim is based on the ‘Will’

of the deceased following procedure is

to be followed:—

(i) A public notice as issued by the

Directorate of Civil Aviation shall be

published in the two local news

papers (one in Devnagari and one in

English) at the cost of the applicant

seeking objections if any within a

period of 15 days of publication. The

applicant shall produce the copy of

the newspaper advertisement to the

Directorate of Civil Aviation.

(ii) Genuinety and validity of the “Will”

shall be ascertained by sending the

same to the authority where the

“Will” is registered.

4. In case the amount of compensation

claim is upto Rs. 2.00 lakhs and claimant

is unable to produce any of the above

documents mentioned in Para (1) or (2)

or (3) above, the Director after verifying

following documents subject to his

satisfaction pass an appropriate order of

disbursement of compensation:—

(i) Death certificate of the deceased.

(ii) Self-declaration about legal heirs.

(iii) Birth/Marriage certificate of all the

legal heirs for establishing relation

with the deceased.

(iv) Independent affidavit from third

party certifying the details given in

the self-declaration.

(v) Photo identity.

(vi) Indemnity bond in the format

prescribed by Law Department.

(vii) Any other document required on

case to case to basis.

(viii) Local enquiry report from the

Mamlatdar.

5. In all the cases indemnity bond shall be

obtained as per format approved by the

Law Department.

This issues with concurrence of Finance

Expenditure Department vide U.O/FMS

No. 1400038679 dated 21-12-2017.

By order and in the name of the

Governor of Goa.

W. V. R. Murthy, Secretary (Civil Aviation).

Porvorim, 1st January, 2018.

———ttt———

Department  of  Finance

Revenue and Control Division

——

Order

6/3/2017-Fin(R&C)/213

Sanction of the Government is hereby

accorded for revival of 8 posts of Commercial

Tax Officer (Group ‘B’ Gazetted), in the pay

scale of Rs. 9,300-34,800+G.P. 4,600 (Pre-

revised), in the Office of the Commissioner of

Commercial Taxes, Panaji-Goa.

The expenditure towards the pay and

allowances shall be debitable under the

respective Budget Head.

This issues with the concurrence of Finance

(Rev. & Cont.) Department vide U. O. No.

1400045091 dated 18-12-2017 and the

approval of Hon’ble Chief Minister in relaxation

to the requirements of O. M. No. 8/3/2006-

-Fin(R&C) (Part-I) (B), dated 30-11-2016 and

Circular No. 1-1-2017-Addl-Secy(PER), dated

24-11-2017.

By order and in the name of the Governor

of Goa.

Sushama D. Kamat, Under Secretary,

Finance (R&C).

Porvorim, 22nd December, 2017.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 40 4TH JANUARY, 2018

1903

Department  of  Labour

Inspectorate of Factories and Boilers

——

Notification

VI/FAC-6(L-1)Part-1/IFB-2017/3672

Whereas, the draft rules, namely, the Goa Factories (Fourteenth Amendment) Rules, 2017

which the Government of Goa proposed to make in exercise of the powers conferred by section

112 of the Factories Act, 1948 (Central Act No. 63 of 1948) so as to further amend the Goa

Factories Rules, 1985 were pre-published as required by section 115 of the said Act, vide

Notification No. VI/FAC-6(L-1)Part-1/IFB-2017/2311 dated 14-9-2017 of the Inspectorate of

Factories and Boilers, in the Official Gazette, Series I No. 25 dated 21-9-2017, inviting objections

and suggestions from all persons likely to be affected thereby before expiry of forty-five days

from the date of publication of the said Notification in the Official Gazette;

And whereas, the said Official Gazette was made available to the public on 21st September,
2017.

And whereas, no objections or suggestions are received from the public on the said draft
Rules by the Government within the stipulated period.

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 112 of the Factories Act, 1948
(Central Act No. 63 of 1948) and all other powers enabling it in this behalf, the Government of
Goa hereby makes the following rules so as to further amend the Goa Factories Rules, 1985,

namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.— (1) These rules may be called the Goa Factories

(Fourteenth Amendment) Rules, 2017.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. Amendment of rule 6.— In rule 6 of the Goa Factories Rules, 1985 (hereinafter referred to

as the “principal Rules”),–

  (i) in sub-rule (2), for the Schedule, the following Schedule shall be substituted, namely:—

“SCHEDULE

Scale of fees payable for licence and annual renewal of licence by Factories

Nil 0 330 550 2200 3300 6600 13200 26400 39600 51700

Upto 10 440 880 2200 4400 6600 9900 19800 39600 51700 64900

Above 10 but

not above 50 660 2200 3300 6600 9900 13200 26400 48400 59400 71500

Above 50 but

not above 100 2200 3300 4400 9900 13200 19800 33000 58300 64900 78100

Above 100 but

not above 500 4400 5500 7700 19800 26400 33000 48400 64900 78100 90200

Above 500 but
not above 1000 7700 8800 16500 26400 36300 42900 64900 78100 90200 103400

Quantity of H. P.

Installed

(Maximum H.P.)

MAXIMUM NUMBER OF WORKERS TO BE EMPLOYED ON ANY DAY DURING THE YEAR

Upto

9

Rs.

From

10 to 20

Rs.

From

21 to 50

Rs.

From

51 to 150

Rs.

From

151 to

250

Rs.

From

251 to

500

Rs.

From

501 to

1000

Rs.

From

1001 to

2500

Rs.

From

2501 to

4000

Rs.

4001

and

Above

Rs.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 40 4TH JANUARY, 2018

1904

Above 1000 but

not above 2000 11000 15400 20900 36300 42900 51700 71500 90200 103400 121000

Above 2000 but

not above 5000 15400 20900 36300 42900 51700 71500 90200 103400 121000 132000

Above 5000 but

not above 10000 23100 30800 53900 63800 78100 106700 143000 165000 176000 198000

Above 10000 34100 46200 80300 94600 121000 165000 209000 242000 264000 297000

(ii) after sub-rule (2), the following sub-rule shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3) In case of a factory coming within the scope of the Act, where the application for

registration and grant of license is made after the commencement of the manufacturing

process, the occupier and manager, from the date of commencement of the manufacturing

process till the date of submission of application for registration and grant of license, shall be

liable to pay additional fee at the rate of two hundred percent of the fees payable per year, as

specified in sub-rule (2).”

3. Amendment of rule 9.— In rule 9 of the principal Rules,–

 (i) in sub-rule (1), for the words “five years”, the words “ten years” shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-rule (2),–

(a) in clause (a), for the words “five years”, the words “ten years” shall be substituted;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “five years”, the words “ten years” shall be

substituted.

4. Amendment of rule 143.— In rule 143 of the principal Rules, after sub-rule (2), the following

sub-rule shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2A) Information sent under sub-rule (2) shall be accompanied by a treasury receipt or

an invoice for book adjustment, as the case may be, for payment of the fees due to be paid, if

any, till the date of closure and a declaration stating that there is no presence of hazardous

chemicals in the premises of the closed factory or the said hazardous chemicals have been

shifted/disposed off in accordance with the relevant rules in force.”.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Goa.

Vivek P. Marathe, Chief Inspector & ex officio Joint Secretary (Factories & Boilers).

Panaji, 22nd December, 2017.

———ttt———

Mormugao Port Trust
—

Mormugao Port Trust Employees’ (Recruitment, Seniority and Promotion) Regulations, 2010

Notification

In exercise of the powers conferred by Regulation 5 and in accordance with Regulation 4 of

the Mormugao Port Trust Employees’ (Recruitment, Seniority and Promotion) Regulations, 2010

the schedule laying down the manner of appointment for Class II, III and IV posts consolidated,

including amendments, made from time to time by the Board of Trustees of the Port of Mormugao

are here set out in the schedule annexed to this Notification and published as per Sub-Section

(1) (a) of Section 132 of the Major Port Trusts Act, 1963 (38 of 1963).

Sd/-

(I. JEYAKUMAR)

Chairman of the Board of Trustees

Mormugao, 7th December, 2017.     of the Port of Mormugao.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 40 4TH JANUARY, 2018

1905

 M
e

c
h

a
n

ic
a

l 
D

e
p

a
rt

m
e

n
t 

(R
e

v
is

e
d

 R
e

c
ru

it
m

e
n

t 
R

u
le

s
)

1
  
  
  
  
2

  
  
  
  
  
  
  
3

  
  
4

  
  
  
  
  
  
5

  
  
  
  
  
  
 6

  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
 7

  
  
  
8

  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
9

  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
1

0
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
 1

1
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
 1

2
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
1

3
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
 1

4

N
a
m

e

o
f

th
e

p
o

s
t

A
g

e
 l

im
it

fo
r 

d
ir

e
c
t

re
c
ru

it
s

P
e
ri

o
d

o
f

p
ro

b
a
-

ti
o

n

M
e
th

o
d

s 
o

f

re
c
ru

it
m

e
n

t,

w
h

e
th

e
r 

d
ir

e
c
t

re
c
ru

it
s 

o
r

b
y

 p
ro

m
o

ti
o

n

o
r 

d
e
p

u
ta

ti
o

n
/

/t
ra

n
sf

e
r 

a
n

d

p
e
rc

e
n

ta
g

e

o
f 

v
a
c
a
n

c
ie

s

to
 b

e 
fi

ll
ed

  
b
y

v
a
ri

o
u

s 
m

e
th

o
d

s

In
 c

a
se

 o
f 

re
c
ru

it
-

m
e
n

t 
b

y
 p

ro
m

o
ti

o
n

/

/d
e
p

u
ta

ti
o

n
/

/t
ra

n
sf

e
r,

 g
ra

d
e
s 

fr
o

m

w
h

ic
h

 p
ro

m
o

ti
o

n
/

/d
e
p

u
ta

ti
o

n
/t

ra
n

sf
e
r

 t
o
 b

e 
m

ad
e

E
d

u
c
a
ti

o
n

a
l

a
n

d
 o

th
e
r

q
u

a
li

fi
c
a
ti

o
n

s

re
q

u
ir

e
d

 f
o

r

d
ir

e
c
t 

re
c
ru

it
s

C
la

ss
if

i-

c
a

ti
o

n

Whether (a) age  (b) educational

qualifications (c) experience for

direct recruits will apply in the

case of promotion/absorption/

deputation.

N
u

m
b

e
r

o
f

p
o

st
s

P
e

rm
a

n
e

n
t/

/T
e

m
p

o
-

ra
ry

S
ca

le

o
f

p
a

y

C
o

m
p

o
-

si
ti

o
n

o
f

S
S

C
/D

P
C

A
p

p
o

in
ti

n
g

A
u

th
o

ri
ty

1
1

.
S

e
le

c
-

ti
o
n

.

II
.

R
s
.

1
6
,4

0
0
-

-4
0
,5

0
0
.

4
0
 y

rs
.

(a
) 
A

g
e
: 
N

o

(b
) 

E
d

u
c
a

-

ti
o
n

a
l

Q
u

a
l.

: 
Y

e
s
.

(c
) 

E
x

p
e
ri

-

e
n

c
e
: 

a
s
 i

n

c
o

l
u

m
n

N
o
. 1

2
.

2

y
e
a

rs
.

(1
) 

6
6

2
/3

%
 

b
y

p
ro

m
o

ti
o

n
 f

a
il

-

in
g

 w
h

ic
h

 b
y

d
ir

e
c
t 

re
c
ru

it
-

m
e
n

t.

(2
) 

3
3

1
/3

%
 

b
y

G
ra

d
u

a
te

 h
a

v
-

in
g

 
re

q
u

ir
e

d

q
u

a
li

fi
c
a

ti
o

n
 &

e
x
p

e
ri

e
n

c
e
.

A
s
s
t.

E
n

g
n

.

(E
le

c
-

-t
ri

c
a

l)
.

(1
) 

P
ro

m
o

ti
o

n
 f

ro
m

a
m

o
n

g
 F

o
re

m
a

n
(E

)
p

o
s

s
e

s
s

in
g

 
th

e
e

d
u

c
a

t
i

o
n

a
l

q
u

a
li

fi
c

a
ti

o
n

 
a

s
p

re
s
c
ri

b
e

d
 i

n
 c

o
l.

 8
a

lo
n

g
 
w

it
h

 
2

 
y

rs
.

e
x

p
e

ri
e

n
c
e

 i
n

 t
h

a
t

g
ra

d
e
, 
fa

il
in

g
 w

h
ic

h
b

y
 p

ro
m

o
ti

o
n

 f
ro

m
a
m

o
n

g
 J

r.
 E

n
g

in
e
e
rs

(E
) 

p
o

s
s
e

s
s
in

g
 t

h
e

e
d

u
c

a
t

i
o

n
a

l
q

u
a

li
fi

c
a

ti
o

n
 

a
s

p
re

s
c
ri

b
e

d
 i

n
 c

o
l.

 8
a
lo

n
g

 w
it

h
 3

 y
rs

. e
x
p

.
in

 
th

a
t 

g
ra

d
e

R
e
la

x
a
b

le
 b

y
 1

 y
r.

 f
o
r

S
C

/.
S

T
s
.

C
h

a
ir

m
a

n
–
D

y.
C

h
a

ir
m

a
n

M
e
m

b
e
r

(1
) 
H

O
D

 w
h

e
re

th
e

 v
a

c
a

n
c
y

e
x
is

ts
.

(2
) 
S

e
c
re

ta
ry

/
/M

P
T

(3
) 
A

s
s
o

c
ia

te
m

e
m

b
e

r 
o

f 
S

C
/

/S
T

/O
B

C
n

o
m

in
a

te
d

 b
y

th
e

 C
h

a
ir

m
a

n
o

f 
th

e
 B

o
a

rd
.

D
y.

C
h

a
ir

-

m
a

n
.

E
s
s
e
n

ti
a

l:

(a
) 

D
e

g
re

e
 i

n
 E

le
c
-

tr
ic

a
l/

E
le

c
tr

o
n

ic
s
  &

C
o

m
m

u
n

ic
a

ti
o

n
s

E
n

g
in

e
e

ri
n

g
 f
ro

m
 a

re
c
o

g
n

is
e

d
 U

n
iv

e
r-

s
it

y
/I

n
s
ti

tu
ti

o
n

 o
r

e
q

u
iv

a
le

n
t.

(b
) 

N
o

t 
le

s
s
 t

h
a

n
 3

y
e
a

rs
 e

x
p

e
ri

e
n

c
e
 i
n

E
le

c
tr

ic
a
l E

n
g

in
e
e
r-

in
g

 W
o
rk

s
.

O
R

(a
) 
D

ip
lo

m
a

 i
n

 E
le

c
-

tr
ic

a
l/

E
le

c
tr

o
n

ic
s
 &

C
o

m
m

u
n

ic
a

ti
o

n
s

/
E

le
c
tr

o
n

ic
s
 &

 T
e
le

-
c

o
m

m
u

n
ic

a
ti

o
n

s
E

n
g

in
e

e
ri

n
g

 (
3

y
rs

.
c

o
u

rs
e

) 
fr

o
m

 
a

re
c
o

g
n

is
e

d
 I

n
s
ti

tu
-

ti
o
n

 o
r 

e
q

u
iv

a
le

n
t.

(b
) 

N
o

t 
le

s
s

 t
h

a
n

6
 y

rs
. 
e

x
p

e
ri

e
n

c
e

 i
n

E
le

c
tr

ic
a
l E

n
g

in
e
e
r-

in
g

 w
o
rk

s
.

W
h

e
th

e
r

se
le

c
ti

o
n

o
r 

n
o

n
-

-s
e
le

c
ti

o
n

Serial No.

1
.

V
. 
 N

o
. 
A

-1
7
0
5
/2

0
1
7

w
w

w
.g

o
ap

ri
n
ti

n
g
p
re

ss
.g

o
v.

in

P
ri

n
te

d
  

an
d

 P
u

b
li

sh
ed

  
b

y
  

th
e 

 D
ir

ec
to

r,
  

P
ri

n
ti

n
g
  

&
  

S
ta

ti
o

n
er

y,

G
o
v
er

n
m

en
t 

 P
ri

n
ti

n
g
  

P
re

ss
,

M
ah

at
m

a 
G

an
d
h
i 

R
o
ad

, 
P

an
aj

i-
G

o
a 

4
0
3
 0

0
1
.

P
R

IC
E

 –
 R

s
. 
 5

.0
0

P
R

IN
T

E
D

 A
T

 T
H

E
 G

O
V

E
R

N
M

E
N

T
 P

R
IN

T
IN

G
 P

R
E

S
S

, 
P

A
N

A
J
I-

G
O

A
—

3
5

4
/2

0
0

—
1

/2
0

1
8

.


